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1 1345 VİLDAN SENA ARIK 6  F 67 5 3 65,34 434,36 14 1 13,67 9 1 8,67 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,67 13 2 12,33 13 0 13,00 3 3 1

2 463 ARDA MERT 6  A 69 6 0 67,01 428,53 14 1 13,67 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 11 4 9,67 14 1 13,67 1 1 1

3 1456 HATİCE RÜMEYSA B 6  I 68 7 0 65,67 423,35 14 1 13,67 9 1 8,67 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 10 5 8,33 15 0 15,00 2 2 1

4 826 ABDULLAH KEREM Ö 6  I 66 9 0 63,00 415,50 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 13 2 12,33 13 2 12,33 4 4 2

5 1528 MERVE TUĞALAY 6  F 66 9 0 63,00 414,00 13 2 12,33 9 1 8,67 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 11 4 9,67 15 0 15,00 4 4 2

6 488 EREN BALOKO 6  A 65 10 0 61,67 402,47 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,67 11 4 9,67 14 1 13,67 7 7 2

7 567 KAAN YEŞİLDAL 6  B 62 5 8 60,34 395,02 13 1 12,67 10 0 10,00 9 1 8,67 7 1 6,67 10 2 9,33 13 0 13,00 8 8 1

8 193 NURGÜL GÜLER 6  F 60 9 6 57,00 393,89 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 3 1 2,67 14 1 13,67 13 2 12,33 11 11 3

9 95 ESAT GÖKTÜRK BEB 6  D 66 9 0 63,00 392,89 12 3 11,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 11 4 9,67 13 2 12,33 4 4 1

10 369 MEHMET SAFVAN Çİ 6  A 62 13 0 57,67 382,66 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 13 2 12,33 12 3 11,00 9 9 3

11 126 GÜNEŞ ERDOĞAN 6  A 62 13 0 57,67 382,22 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 11 4 9,67 13 2 12,33 9 9 3

12 1519 SÜMEYYE KOÇAK 6  F 59 11 5 55,33 376,28 12 2 11,33 7 2 6,33 7 0 7,00 8 2 7,33 11 4 9,67 14 1 13,67 13 13 4

13 340 MUHAMMED TARIK A 6  G 59 13 3 54,68 372,21 14 1 13,67 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 11 1 10,67 11 4 9,67 16 16 1

14 65 CİHAN MERT KARAB 6  J 60 14 1 55,34 368,17 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 7 3 6,00 11 3 10,00 14 1 13,67 12 12 1

15 44 BEREN DEMİRCİ 6  D 60 15 0 54,99 365,47 13 2 12,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 8 2 7,33 10 5 8,33 13 2 12,33 15 15 2

16 1268 CEMALEDDİN ÖZBEK 6  D 57 18 0 51,00 359,54 14 1 13,67 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 3 7 0,67 13 2 12,33 10 5 8,33 23 23 3

17 1256 ZAHİDE YILDIZ 6  B 58 14 3 53,34 356,34 14 1 13,67 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 6 3 5,00 10 3 9,00 11 4 9,67 18 18 2

18 18 ARDA BERK YILMAZ 6  J 59 16 0 53,67 355,14 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,67 11 4 9,67 11 4 9,67 17 17 2

19 82 ELİF ECE POLAT 6  F 58 15 2 53,00 354,17 13 2 12,33 8 1 7,67 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 10 4 8,67 12 3 11,00 19 19 5

20 1463 MERT ALİ YILDIRI 6  J 57 16 2 51,67 352,77 13 2 12,33 6 4 4,67 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 12 2 11,33 10 4 8,67 21 21 3

21 1168 MUHAMMED BERAT Ş 6  B 55 19 1 48,67 346,38 11 4 9,67 6 4 4,67 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 13 1 12,67 12 3 11,00 27 27 4

22 181 NEHİR EYLÜL SAĞN 6  A 60 15 0 55,01 344,53 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 10 0 10,00 11 4 9,67 11 4 9,67 14 14 5

23 467 EDANUR CENGİZ 6  I 58 15 2 52,99 332,95 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 8 2 7,33 9 5 7,33 11 3 10,00 20 20 3

24 325 ZAHİDE TATAR 6  B 56 19 0 49,66 332,62 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 5 5 3,33 9 6 7,00 12 3 11,00 25 25 3

25 661 MUSTAFA SAİD GÜZ 6  E 56 13 6 51,67 328,94 11 2 10,33 9 1 8,67 9 0 9,00 6 1 5,67 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,67 21 21 1
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26 822 EGE ALTUNTAŞ 6  D 54 21 0 46,99 324,84 11 4 9,67 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 13 2 12,33 10 5 8,33 30 30 5

27 1232 ELİF BETÜL AKBÖR 6  D 55 17 3 49,33 314,27 13 2 12,33 10 0 10,00 10 0 10,00 4 5 2,33 10 3 9,00 8 7 5,67 26 26 4

28 827 ASUDE SENA ANAÇ 6  B 54 17 4 48,33 310,80 12 2 11,33 7 3 6,00 10 0 10,00 6 3 5,00 7 6 5,00 12 3 11,00 28 28 5

29 875 ASLINUR TÜZEL 6  A 54 19 2 47,67 307,68 11 4 9,67 4 6 2,00 9 1 8,67 10 0 10,00 9 5 7,33 11 3 10,00 29 29 6

30 66 ÇAĞATAY TARAZ 6  F 55 15 5 50,00 307,54 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 9 1 8,67 7 4 5,67 9 5 7,33 24 24 6

31 1492 CEYLİNSU AYDOĞDU 6  B 52 21 2 45,01 305,70 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 5 4 3,67 11 4 9,67 10 4 8,67 39 39 7

32 415 ENİSE NURAY BOZB 6  H 53 19 3 46,67 303,68 10 4 8,67 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 4 5 2,33 10 4 8,67 11 4 9,67 32 32 1

33 1493 AZRANUR NİLDA KA 6  K 49 20 6 42,34 302,23 14 1 13,67 4 6 2,00 9 1 8,67 4 5 2,33 8 4 6,67 10 3 9,00 47 47 2

34 1905 EREN KÖMÜR 6  F 53 20 2 46,33 301,12 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,67 9 1 8,67 7 2 6,33 10 5 8,33 11 3 10,00 33 33 7

35 901 ALİ EFE TEMİZEL 6  F 47 23 5 39,33 299,64 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 3 7 0,67 9 2 8,33 12 3 11,00 57 57 10

36 1366 ADNAN ATILGAN 6  F 50 25 0 41,67 297,79 12 3 11,00 2 8 0,67 9 1 8,67 6 4 4,67 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,67 51 51 9

37 635 FATMA BOSTAN 6  B 53 22 0 45,66 297,74 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,67 36 36 6

38 545 FURKAN ALİ USLUO 6  E 52 19 4 45,66 296,92 12 3 11,00 6 3 5,00 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 10 5 8,33 8 4 6,67 36 36 4

39 224 SADİ UTKU ALBAYR 6  J 50 23 2 42,34 286,43 11 4 9,67 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,67 5 4 3,67 7 7 4,67 13 2 12,33 47 47 5

40 191 NUR CEMRE BOYRAZ 6  E 53 21 1 45,99 286,08 10 5 8,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 8 6 6,00 11 4 9,67 35 35 3

41 462 KUBİLAY CEYLAN 6  J 53 21 1 46,00 285,67 12 3 11,00 8 2 7,33 10 0 10,00 6 4 4,67 8 6 6,00 9 6 7,00 34 34 4

42 807 BEYZA SÖNMEZ 6  B 52 23 0 44,34 285,13 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 6 4 4,67 10 5 8,33 11 4 9,67 40 40 8

43 200 ÖMER BUĞRA DOĞAN 6  A 49 24 2 41,01 284,20 14 1 13,67 6 4 4,67 10 0 10,00 2 8 0,67 7 7 4,67 10 4 8,67 53 53 7

44 788 AYSİMA AKAY 6  E 53 19 3 46,68 283,55 11 4 9,67 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 9 1 8,67 9 4 7,67 8 7 5,67 31 31 2

45 1439 KEREM SALİH METE 6  K 51 21 3 44,00 283,13 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,67 8 5 6,33 10 4 8,67 42 42 1

46 1505 SELVİ NAZ GELMEZ 6  H 51 24 0 43,01 281,37 11 4 9,67 6 4 4,67 9 1 8,67 6 4 4,67 10 5 8,33 9 6 7,00 44 44 3

47 873 ABDULLAH SAİD DU 6  H 48 12 15 44,01 280,40 11 4 9,67 9 1 8,67 8 1 7,67 4 2 3,33 4 1 3,67 12 3 11,00 41 41 2

48 119 GÖKTÜRK METE TAN 6  D 51 17 7 45,34 278,52 12 2 11,33 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 8 1 7,67 6 4 4,67 9 6 7,00 38 38 6

49 149 KAYAHAN İLKER KA 6  G 51 24 0 43,01 274,05 9 6 7,00 7 3 6,00 9 1 8,67 6 4 4,67 11 4 9,67 9 6 7,00 44 44 2

50 305 AHMET ARAS ALTUN 6  F 49 16 10 43,67 273,66 11 3 10,00 5 4 3,67 9 0 9,00 8 1 7,67 6 5 4,33 10 3 9,00 43 43 8
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51 627 KEREM AKDA 6  K 46 22 7 38,67 273,05 11 3 10,00 3 6 1,00 9 1 8,67 4 4 2,67 9 3 8,00 10 5 8,33 60 60 5

52 326 ZEYNEP AYYILDIZ 6  G 49 20 6 42,34 271,32 11 2 10,33 6 4 4,67 8 1 7,67 7 2 6,33 6 7 3,67 11 4 9,67 50 50 3

53 633 NERİS YILDIZ 6  D 49 19 7 42,68 269,71 14 1 13,67 6 3 5,00 9 1 8,67 7 3 6,00 5 4 3,67 8 7 5,67 46 46 7

54 507 HÜMEYRA KOCABAY 6  K 48 22 5 40,66 265,66 13 2 12,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 3 6 1,00 6 6 4,00 9 5 7,33 55 55 4

55 1472 ŞEYMA NUR BULUT 6  K 49 20 6 42,34 265,43 11 4 9,67 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 5 4 3,67 6 7 3,67 10 2 9,33 47 47 2

56 120 GÜLSEREN ELA YIL 6  H 48 21 6 41,00 263,56 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 8 2 7,33 6 4 4,67 5 4 3,67 10 5 8,33 54 54 4

57 146 KAAN BERKAY KAYA 6  B 50 25 0 41,67 261,55 11 4 9,67 6 4 4,67 9 1 8,67 7 3 6,00 7 8 4,33 10 5 8,33 51 51 9

58 678 AYBERK YUŞA ARSL 6  I 46 25 4 37,65 255,80 12 3 11,00 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 7 5 5,33 9 5 7,33 64 64 4

59 194 NURİ KAYRA ÇELİK 6  E 46 25 4 37,67 254,72 11 4 9,67 5 5 3,33 7 2 6,33 6 4 4,67 8 4 6,67 9 6 7,00 63 63 6

60 973 REYYAN ELİF KUZU 6  E 49 26 0 40,34 251,19 11 4 9,67 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 9 1 8,67 8 7 5,67 8 7 5,67 56 56 5

61 555 BELİS KILIÇ 6  F 42 18 15 36,00 244,04 12 3 11,00 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 2 1 1,67 7 3 6,00 7 5 5,33 66 66 11

62 292 SÜMEYYE KILIÇASL 6  G 40 22 13 32,67 243,48 11 4 9,67 3 7 0,67 8 2 7,33 0 0 0,00 8 5 6,33 10 4 8,67 75 75 5

63 1253 YAĞMUR KOÇER 6  B 47 27 1 38,01 241,87 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,67 9 1 8,67 5 4 3,67 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 62 62 10

64 1356 MEHMET SAFA AKTA 6  I 43 23 9 35,33 240,42 12 2 11,33 7 3 6,00 7 2 6,33 3 7 0,67 4 5 2,33 10 4 8,67 68 68 5

65 1484 ESMA YAYLA 6  C 47 23 5 39,32 239,64 11 3 10,00 7 2 6,33 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 5 8 2,33 9 5 7,33 58 58 1

66 108 FATMA ARAZ 6  C 48 27 0 38,99 237,93 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,67 8 2 7,33 7 8 4,33 9 6 7,00 59 59 2

67 46 BİLAL AYAZ 6  A 45 20 10 38,33 236,88 10 4 8,67 7 3 6,00 9 0 9,00 5 5 3,33 4 3 3,00 10 5 8,33 61 61 8

68 38 BELİNAY USLUOĞLU 6  G 45 23 7 37,33 236,19 11 3 10,00 4 6 2,00 9 0 9,00 7 3 6,00 7 6 5,00 7 5 5,33 65 65 4

69 207 ÖYKÜ NİDA BOZKUR 6  E 40 24 11 32,01 234,57 11 4 9,67 2 5 0,33 8 1 7,67 2 4 0,67 9 4 7,67 8 6 6,00 76 76 7

70 987 YAKUP SAMİ UÇAR 6  E 40 25 10 31,67 229,44 10 5 8,33 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 0 0 0,00 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,67 79 79 9

71 21 ARDA KÜÇÜK 6  J 43 29 3 33,32 224,58 10 5 8,33 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 7 8 4,33 9 3 8,00 73 73 6

72 1263 NİSANUR ARMAĞAN 6  C 42 20 13 35,32 220,96 13 2 12,33 4 5 2,33 10 0 10,00 4 0 4,00 3 8 0,33 8 5 6,33 69 69 3

73 211 POYRAZ EFE SEZER 6  D 43 23 9 35,34 219,77 11 4 9,67 8 1 7,67 9 0 9,00 2 6 0,00 5 7 2,67 8 5 6,33 67 67 8

74 382 UMUT MURAT ÖZBEK 6  B 44 30 1 34,01 217,50 7 7 4,67 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 10 5 8,33 8 7 5,67 71 71 11

75 204 ÖMER PALAS 6  A 42 32 1 31,33 214,55 11 4 9,67 3 7 0,67 8 2 7,33 5 5 3,33 8 6 6,00 7 8 4,33 80 80 10
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76 1349 CEYLİN TÜRKMEN 6  H 41 22 12 33,67 213,64 11 4 9,67 5 1 4,67 10 0 10,00 2 5 0,33 6 8 3,33 7 4 5,67 72 72 5

77 1357 SÜMEYYE KUŞKAYA 6  I 38 23 14 30,34 213,51 13 1 12,67 4 6 2,00 6 2 5,33 4 4 2,67 4 6 2,00 7 4 5,67 84 84 6

78 1283 FATMA NUR ÖCALOĞ 6  D 41 24 10 33,00 210,31 9 6 7,00 5 4 3,67 9 1 8,67 3 2 2,33 8 5 6,33 7 6 5,00 74 74 9

79 297 TARIK BUĞRA TURH 6  A 45 30 0 35,00 209,56 11 4 9,67 6 4 4,67 10 0 10,00 5 5 3,33 6 9 3,00 7 8 4,33 70 70 9

80 584 BELİNAY ALICI 6  A 41 30 4 30,99 209,45 9 5 7,33 4 6 2,00 8 2 7,33 4 5 2,33 9 6 7,00 7 6 5,00 82 82 11

81 596 UTKU TOK 6  B 41 27 7 31,99 206,56 7 8 4,33 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 4 3 3,00 8 5 6,33 9 4 7,67 78 78 12

82 481 ALİ İHSAN ULUTÜR 6  H 41 33 1 30,01 203,94 8 7 5,67 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 4 6 2,00 10 4 8,67 7 8 4,33 85 85 6

83 989 EFSA ERCİYAS 6  E 42 30 3 32,00 202,65 11 4 9,67 7 3 6,00 7 2 6,33 4 5 2,33 6 9 3,00 7 7 4,67 77 77 8

84 921 ORHAN BOYRAZ 6  K 40 35 0 28,34 201,82 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 6 4 4,67 1 9 2,00 5 10 1,67 11 4 9,67 90 90 6

85 594 YİĞİT ARSLAN 6  D 41 30 4 31,00 195,80 12 2 11,33 5 4 3,67 6 4 4,67 7 3 6,00 3 11 0,67 8 6 6,00 81 81 10

86 1536 ESİLA ERGÜL 6  A 40 31 4 29,67 191,34 8 7 5,67 5 5 3,33 9 1 8,67 3 7 0,67 8 5 6,33 7 6 5,00 87 87 12

87 722 MUHAMMED ENES CA 6  E 35 21 19 28,00 186,11 8 5 6,33 4 5 2,33 8 1 7,67 1 0 1,00 7 3 6,00 7 7 4,67 92 92 12

88 1407 KAYRA TEKDEN 6  J 39 30 6 29,00 184,94 12 3 11,00 6 4 4,67 7 3 6,00 4 5 2,33 3 8 0,33 7 7 4,67 89 89 7

89 171 MUHAMMED KAYRA U 6  H 34 37 4 21,66 181,94 13 2 12,33 3 7 0,67 2 8 0,67 4 6 2,00 3 8 0,33 9 6 7,00 98 98 8

90 396 BESTE KİRACI 6  E 41 33 1 29,99 181,82 10 5 8,33 4 6 2,00 8 2 7,33 7 3 6,00 8 6 6,00 4 11 0,33 86 86 11

91 1506 TUĞRAHAN SEZER 6  K 40 35 0 28,33 180,01 8 7 5,67 5 5 3,33 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 6 9 3,00 9 6 7,00 91 91 7

92 234 SALİHA NUR KOCAB 6  E 39 25 11 30,67 179,07 10 3 9,00 7 1 6,67 9 0 9,00 3 6 1,00 5 7 2,67 5 8 2,33 83 83 10

93 100 ESRA GEZE 6  C 38 26 11 29,33 170,30 12 3 11,00 4 6 2,00 9 1 8,67 6 2 5,33 1 8 1,67 6 6 4,00 88 88 4

94 1217 ARZU ECEM OKUYUC 6  A 34 38 3 21,34 152,75 9 6 7,00 3 7 0,67 7 3 6,00 2 7 0,33 6 7 3,67 7 8 4,33 100 100 13

95 345 AYŞE DİNÇER 6  C 33 32 10 22,34 150,65 10 4 8,67 4 4 2,67 5 4 3,67 4 5 2,33 5 8 2,33 5 7 2,67 95 95 5

96 691 BURHAN ÇELEBİ 6  F 35 39 1 22,00 146,06 11 4 9,67 5 5 3,33 6 4 4,67 3 6 1,00 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 97 97 13

97 1233 İLAYDA AYHAN 6  F 37 37 1 24,68 141,29 8 7 5,67 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 4 10 0,67 7 8 4,33 93 93 12

98 1317 ALİ AKPINAR 6  H 34 29 12 24,33 137,97 10 5 8,33 7 3 6,00 7 3 6,00 4 6 2,00 0 3 1,00 6 9 3,00 94 94 7

99 652 ESMANUR KUNDAKSI 6  E 35 39 1 22,01 132,83 9 6 7,00 6 4 4,67 6 4 4,67 4 6 2,00 5 9 2,00 5 10 1,67 96 96 13

100 745 BELİNAY OĞUZ 6  E 31 39 5 18,00 123,67 7 8 4,33 2 8 0,67 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,67 3 7 0,67 9 6 7,00 103 103 14
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101 670 ZEHRA ÖZEL 6  I 24 18 33 18,00 122,98 12 2 11,33 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,67 1 3 0,00 0 0 0,00 1 3 0,00 103 103 7

102 376 MELİSA GÜNER 6  K 33 39 3 19,99 122,34 8 7 5,67 5 2 4,33 7 3 6,00 2 8 0,67 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 101 101 8

103 265 SILA YAREN BOZKU 6  F 35 40 0 21,65 122,11 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 99 99 14

104 1480 ALİ ŞIK 6  C 31 39 5 18,01 119,53 8 7 5,67 3 5 1,33 6 3 5,00 3 7 0,67 4 10 0,67 7 7 4,67 102 102 6

105 244 SALİM ENES DURMU 6  H 31 39 5 18,00 118,15 6 9 3,00 5 5 3,33 3 7 0,67 5 4 3,67 6 8 3,33 6 6 4,00 103 103 9

106 1465 ŞEVVAL CEYLAN 6  J 27 37 11 14,66 117,68 10 4 8,67 1 8 1,67 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 4 5 2,33 4 8 1,33 113 113 8

107 1225 HATİCE ELA ÇAKIR 6  A 32 43 0 17,66 114,18 4 11 0,33 1 9 2,00 7 3 6,00 5 5 3,33 8 7 5,67 7 8 4,33 106 106 14

108 1330 ELMAZE NUR DUMAN 6  F 30 40 5 16,67 111,70 4 9 1,00 4 6 2,00 7 3 6,00 1 9 2,00 5 7 2,67 9 6 7,00 109 109 15

109 1224 EYLÜL BOYRAZ 6  A 26 48 1 9,99 109,17 11 4 9,67 2 8 0,67 1 9 2,00 2 8 0,67 6 8 3,33 4 11 0,33 119 119 16

110 460 EMİR ALP BÜYÜKOD 6  G 28 37 10 15,66 106,59 6 6 4,00 3 5 1,33 4 6 2,00 4 5 2,33 3 11 0,67 8 4 6,67 111 111 6

111 779 YUSUF EYMEN ÖZAY 6  I 28 35 12 16,33 100,84 6 6 4,00 4 4 2,67 6 3 5,00 2 6 0,00 4 11 0,33 6 5 4,33 110 110 8

112 614 ALİ YAĞIZ KAHRAM 6  G 30 45 0 14,99 99,47 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 4 6 2,00 4 11 0,33 7 8 4,33 112 112 7

113 384 TAHSİN BERAT AYT 6  A 31 41 3 17,33 96,69 7 7 4,67 5 5 3,33 8 2 7,33 2 8 0,67 4 10 0,67 5 9 2,00 108 108 15

114 1252 ŞERİFE NUR TARAF 6  B 29 46 0 13,67 94,90 8 7 5,67 3 7 0,67 6 4 4,67 2 8 0,67 6 9 3,00 4 11 0,33 114 114 14

115 1266 BERKUK TOKMAK 6  D 29 46 0 13,67 94,24 9 6 7,00 1 9 2,00 7 3 6,00 3 7 0,67 5 10 1,67 4 11 0,33 114 114 11

116 1235 ATAKAN ATA 6  B 27 29 19 17,34 93,01 9 6 7,00 5 4 3,67 6 2 5,33 3 3 2,00 3 10 0,33 1 4 0,33 107 107 13

117 1247 KERİM ÇINAR ÖCAL 6  B 28 47 0 12,32 73,94 3 12 1,00 2 8 0,67 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 4 11 0,33 9 6 7,00 116 116 15

118 961 İBRAHİM EREN ÖZT 6  F 27 46 2 11,66 71,00 6 9 3,00 2 8 0,67 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 7 7 4,67 2 12 2,00 117 117 16

119 286 SÜLEYMAN KAAN KA 6  E 26 49 0 9,67 68,66 7 8 4,33 3 7 0,67 3 7 0,67 4 6 2,00 6 9 3,00 3 12 1,00 120 120 15

120 495 BENSU DEFNE KUŞO 6  B 26 46 3 10,66 63,52 4 11 0,33 1 7 1,33 5 5 3,33 5 5 3,33 4 10 0,67 7 8 4,33 118 118 16

121 645 ELİF SU ÜLGER 6  K 17 26 32 8,34 61,30 0 0 0,00 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,67 2 7 0,33 6 5 4,33 2 1 1,67 122 122 9

122 1447 ZEYNEP MERT 6  A 25 50 0 8,34 55,80 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 3 7 0,67 3 7 0,67 3 12 1,00 5 10 1,67 122 122 17

123 385 AHMET GÖZÜBERK 6  B 26 49 0 9,66 50,61 7 8 4,33 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,67 2 8 0,67 1 14 3,67 6 9 3,00 121 121 17

124 1344 ŞERİFE BEYZA ALP 6  F 13 17 45 7,34 45,52 4 7 1,67 0 0 0,00 5 5 3,33 0 0 0,00 1 1 0,67 3 4 1,67 124 124 17

125 1348 BUSE TAŞDEMİR 6  H 20 43 12 5,66 41,98 5 8 2,33 1 7 1,33 2 8 0,67 5 4 3,67 4 8 1,33 3 8 0,33 127 127 10
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D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N D Y N GNL KRM SNF

126 494 ZEHRA NAZ KIYICI 6  J 22 51 2 4,99 32,13 10 5 8,33 1 9 2,00 6 4 4,67 2 8 0,67 1 14 3,67 2 11 1,67 128 128 9

127 1227 KARACA AYKAŞ 6  B 21 53 1 3,33 32,07 5 10 1,67 3 6 1,00 2 8 0,67 2 8 0,67 5 10 1,67 4 11 0,33 130 130 18

128 98 ESMANUR BEDİR 6  I 24 51 0 7,00 28,89 6 9 3,00 2 8 0,67 4 6 2,00 6 4 4,67 2 13 2,33 4 11 0,33 125 125 9

129 660 BERAT KESKİN 6  A 22 53 0 4,33 26,86 4 11 0,33 4 6 2,00 2 8 0,67 3 7 0,67 2 13 2,33 7 8 4,33 129 129 18

130 337 METEHAN AKKULAK 6  D 23 51 1 5,99 2,51 3 12 1,00 4 6 2,00 8 2 7,33 2 8 0,67 2 12 2,00 4 11 0,33 126 126 12

131 519 BELİNAY DAMILI 6  E 18 55 2 0,34 11,65 4 11 0,33 4 6 2,00 4 5 2,33 0 9 3,00 2 13 2,33 4 11 0,33 131 131 16

132 1024 AHMET DURAN ÖZCA 6  D 17 57 1 2,01 21,50 4 11 0,33 2 8 0,67 2 8 0,67 4 6 2,00 1 13 3,33 4 11 0,33 133 133 13

133 92 ENEZ AHMET SEVEN 6  I 17 57 1 2,00 28,11 2 13 2,33 4 6 2,00 1 9 2,00 4 6 2,00 2 12 2,00 4 11 0,33 132 132 10

134 1390 LÜTFİ EFE AYDIN 8  D 12 61 2 8,33 49,93 3 12 1,00 0 10 3,33 1 9 2,00 3 6 1,00 2 13 2,33 3 11 0,67 134 134 1

ORTALAMA 42,98 27,32 4,70 33,87 221,43 9,94 4,64 8,39 5,47 4,16 4,08 7,31 2,49 6,48 4,98 4,06 3,62 6,90 6,34 4,78 8,39 5,62 6,51




